Proposal
for
Panola County Court House

March 29, 2018

Deseription Qty Price Tatal
SV83 AD EXT Migrations {AnalagiDigital) 192 $ 45,00 $ 8,640.00
SV83 UMBK UMS CLIENT.1 LIC [Valce Mail} 1 s 5,0600.00 S $,000.00
SV83 RESOURCE-1 LIC 115 $ 85,00 $ 10,925.00
GPZ 64 PLA 1 5 2,600.00 3 2,600.00
5V93 VOIR CH-16 LIC 1 s 320.00 ] 320,00
SV93 V5 Sofhware 1 3 300000 $ 3.000.00 |
SVe1 SIP CPU Migration Kit 1 5 7,600.00 $ 7,000.00
UMB000 Vi ) plus 100 Mall Box Lic {$3400.00} disc 1 $ 688800 9§ 6,888.00
GCD-16DLCA 1 S 550.00 $ 550,00
SV338YS Migrafion 1 3 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
5 Year Software Assurance/Support and Hasdware Warranty 1 3 1000000 8 10.000.00
Programming SV83 to V93 setiing up network 1 ] 2,500.00 $ 5 2,500.00
: Sublotal  MRSP $ ' £0,423.00
MOTES: Discount S {24,000.00)
§ 36,423.00

ALL Discounts good untill Apr 6th 2018f Payment is DUE UPON Total

INSTALLATION in FUL

Date

VIP Technologies, Inc.

z_aj_, EZ

Dale

%%@w 3y

County Judge

Date

1
Mailing: PO Box 9280, Longview, TX 75608
TEL#903-297-5583 /f FAX 903-297-4539
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FW: RE: Phone system upgrade

From: leeann.jones@co.pancla.tx.us

Sent: Thu, Mar 29, 2018 at 11:19 am

To: vicki.heinkel@co.pancla.tx.us, sidney.burns@co.panola.tx.us
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-----Original Message—-

From: "Steven Carroll" <stevec@viptechnologies.net>

Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 11:17am

To: "leeann.jones@co.panola.tx.us" <leeann.jones@co.panola.tx.us>
Subject: RE: Phone system upgrade

See if this works corrected both email and PDF
Thank you

Stoven A Carrol!

Owner
VIP Technologies, Inc.

O {903-297-5583 x2103

E | stevec@viptechnologies.net
W | viptechnologies.net

NEW! Cloud Business Phone Systems | Voice over IP Solutions | Structure Cabling | Phone System Sales & installation |
Telecom Support '
“Superior Solutions and Service For Your Business Communication Needs®

From: leeann.jones@co.panola.tx.us [mailto:leeann.jones@co.panola.tx.us]
Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 10:58 AM

To: Steven Carroll

Subject: RE: Phone system upgrade

Steven:

Please revise your proposal to show us paying the $3400. Need this asap as my assistant is preparing
packets for court.

Thanks,

Lee Ann

https://cira.mymailsrvr.com/versions/webmail/12.13 .3-RC/popup.php?wsid=e9cafc8892af... 3/29/2018
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—-COriginal Message—-

From: "Steven Carroll" <stevec@viptechnologies.net>

Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2018 9:52am

To: "leeann.jones@co.pancla.tx.us” <leeann.jones@co.panola.tx.us>
Subject: Phone system upgrade

Jude Jones ) i
8 years ago VIP Technologies installed the SV8300 Phone System come May 31st we will no longer be
able to get service from NEC due to the Software support ending come 1 Dec2018 will be end of life for
this product. The NEC platform allows migration to the next generation system the SV93.

With this quote the Main Processor (CPU ) and Voice Mail will be replaced plus ali the licensee that are
needed { $36,423.00) programmed and Installed

This will give the Court House another Syears of Hardware and software coverage/support from NEC for
these parts. At the need of the 5 years 2023 you can buy another software assurance program for 5 years
2028 giving you a total of 10 more years out of this system upgrade and system. ' - :

The Phones will not be covered if they go bad you would just replace them with the newer model phones
which would come with a 5 year warranty on them.

This price is good for this month only and the Voice Mail replacement part discount will go away at the end of
this month ( March 30t 2018)

NEC end of year is March 315t 2018

NEC has given me 60days to pay this note if you would like to move forward with this [ can order the system
will need PO # for the amount of $36423.00, Then payment will be due after installation.

In 2023 the software Warranty should be no more than 10k {(more than likely less) for 5 more years.
Please call me if you have questions or concefns

If you like | can come out to your office this afternoon, I will not need a check today only your approval to
go forward.

Thank you

Steven A, Carrofl

Owner
VIP Technologies, Inc.

O | 903-297-5583 x2103

E | stevec@viptechnologies.net
W | viptechnologies.net

NEW! Cloud Business Phone Systems | Voice over IP Solutions | Structure Cabling | Phone System Sales & Installation |
Telecom Support

https://cira.mymailsrvr.com/versions/webmail/12.13.3-RC/popup.php?wsid=e9cafc8892af... 3/29/2018
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"Superior Solutions and Service For Your Business Communication Needs®

https://cira.mymailsrvr.com/versions/webmail/12.13.3-RC/p opup.php?wsid=e9cafc8892af... 3/29/2018



